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I. SPECIAL ASSEMBLIES 
 
1. International Youth day: 
International Youth Day (IYD) is an awareness day designated by the United Nations that 
takes place on August 12.The purpose of the day is to draw attention to a given set of 
cultural and legal issues surrounding youth. The first IYD was observed on 12 August 
2000. 
 
A special assembly was performed on 11th January 2024 to celebrate the event. The theme 
and the importance of the day was presented by the students of class 7th. The children 
danced wonderfully to the tunes of  few songs – The students have also taken Oath and  
presented various quotes using placards. 
 
Thought  for the day: “  Humanity depends on the boundless energy, ideas, contributions 
of youth everywhere. 
 
2.Vijay Diwas: 

Vijay Diwas is commemorated on December 16 every year to honor the victory of the 
Indian armed forces over Pakistan in the 1971 war and to pay tribute to the soldiers who 
sacrificed their lives for the country.  
 
On 25th January 2024, a special assembly was performed by the students of class 8 th to 
celebrate “Vijay Diwas”. The event included a skit on the theme “ We should respect our 
soldiers”. Dance and  a song were also performed  
 
Thought  for the day: “ Faith is the one that feels the light even when dawn is still dark. 
 
3. Medhavi Awards:  The Medhavi Award function was conducted on 12th January and the 
awards were given to the meritorious candidates on the basis of their performance in Half 
yearly examination. 
 
4. Republic Day(KG):- 
On 23rd January NKG celebrated special assembly on account of Republic Day. The 
program was commenced by flag hoisting ceremony followed by speech by UKG children 
on republic day in Hindi and English. A patriotic dance was performed on our constitution 
along with patriotic song which was followed by parade in which children dressed up as a 
freedom fighters. 
 
 
5. REPUBLIC DAY (I-XII) 
 
The school celebrated Republic day on 26 January 2024 through the various activities:  
The day started with a welcome speech and followed by hoisting of flag and National 
Anthem. 
 
Class 1: A tableau  by children classes 1 & 2 in the attire of National Leaders followed by a 
speech. 
 



Teachers speech: A speech on the importance of ‘Republic day’ was given by D.Vijay 
Lakshmi 
 
Primary group singing competition: On the special occasion  of Republic day, a house wise 
singing competition was conducted in which students mesmerised all the audience and 
judges with their melodious patriotic songs.  
              
 
6. Navy Day: 
 
Navy Day in India is celebrated on 4 December every year to recognize the achievements 
and role of the Indian Navy to the country.  On this day, those killed in the Indo-Pakistan 
War of 1971 are also remembered 
 
On 31st January 2024 a special assembly was conducted by Cubs & Bulbuls . Students 
showcased that one should be prepared physically, mentally and financially to help others 
in difficult situations. The students sang a  melodious song as a  –  tribute the Kargil 
warriors   
 
Thought  for the day:  “Be prepared to help anyone either physically, mentally and 
financially”. 
 
Students of classes 3-5  showcased their talent through their dance on various patriotic 
songs to energize and motivate the youngsters towards the nation. 
 
 
II. EXAMINATIONS AND PTI: 
 
1. PTI of the class VI -XII: The PTI of VI-XII classes for post mid term exams was 
conducted on 6th January. 
 
2.Class X Pre-board 2:  The Pre-board II examination for class X commenced on 19th  
January and concluded on 2nd February.  
 
3.Class XII Pre-board 3: The Pre-board III examination for class XII commenced on 25th 
January and concluded on 7th February.  
 
 
III. AWARDS AND FELICITATIONS: 

 
1. Ayaz of class 2R received bronze medal for skating at state level championship 
conducted by ‘A.P. Speed skating associations’ in 23rd Dec 2023. 
 
2. Jeffrin Johnson of class 2Q received Silver medal in Abacus fest 2024 conducted by 
‘Little stars abacus academy PVT. LTD’ on 7th Jan. 
 

3. Painting Competition :  Sushree Sai Shivani of class 9P secured 4th position in painting 

competition organised by KVS on 23rd January under Pariksha Pe Charcha 

 

 



VII OTHER ACTIVITIES: 
 
Road Safety Lecture 
Navy Children School, 104 Area, Visakhapatnam, hosted a guest speaker lecture on 10 th 
January to create awareness about road safety , among the students of classes 4-12. Total 
900 students along with 25 teachers attended the session. The session was presided over 
by Mr Vasudeva Rao SI of Police Airport Traffic Police Station and his  team. 
 
Students enthusiastically participated in this informative session. Their queries were 
clarified by the guest speakers. The programme culminated with a vote of thanks. 
 
Dental check-up(KG) 

Naval Kinder Garten has organized a Dental check up camp on 24 January 2024 with the 
aim of promoting Oral health awareness and providing basic services to the students of 
NKG. The event was organized in collaboration with INHS Kalyani and it saw active partic-
ipation from students. 

Surg Capt Maninder  Hundal, VSM, Oi/C Dental Centre, INHS Kalyani has inaugurated the 
camp. The primary objective of the medical camp was to create awareness about the im-
portance of Oral health and to address common health issues faced by students, to em-
phasize the significance of preventive measures. 

Informative sessions were conducted to educate students about the importance of main-
taining a healthy lifestyle, Oral hygiene practices. 230 students who submitted consent 
have availed the dental check-ups. 

 
 
 
 
           (D.Srividya) 
          Vice-principal 
 
 
 
 
 


